Project: North Forest M.U.D. Water Plant Improvements

Langford Engineering, Inc.
Project No. 259-015, Contract No. 1

Bid Tabulation

All Bidders 150 Calendar Days

Bid Date: 10:00 a.m.

Friday, April 30, 2010
Opened & Read at 10:00 a.m.
Friday, April 30, 2010
Langford Engineering, Inc.
Conference Room

Approx.
Item Quantity [ Pieper-Houston Electric, L.P. Neil Technical Services McDonald Electric Gemini Contracting Services, Inc.| W. W. Payton Corporation
No. Description of Work and Unit| Houston, Texas 5% B.B. [ Houston, Texas 5% B.B. | Houston, Texas 5% B.B. | Houston, Texas 5% B.B. | Katy, Texas 5% B.B.
Base Bid
1. |Mobilization 1
L.S. |$ 15,000.00| $ 15,000.00 |$ 9,250.00 [ $ 9,250.00 | $ 20,000.00 [ $ 20,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 [ $ 5,000.00
Furnish and Install New 400 kW Manufacturer: Manufacturer: Manufacturer: Manufacturer: Manufacturer:
Diesel Emergency Generator MTU Onsite MTU Onsite Detroit Diesel Cummins MTU Onsite
and Automatic Transfer Switch Energy Energy Energy
2. |per the Plans and Specifications 1
L.S. |$ 199,000.00| $ 199,000.00 |[$ 156,765.00 | $ 156,765.00 [ $ 103,000.00 | $ 103,000.00 |$ 158,000.00 [ $ 158,000.00 | $ 170,000.00 | $ 170,000.00
Furnish and Install Replacement
Electrical Service Entrance,
Conductors, and Appurtenances,
3. |per the Plans and Specifications 1
LS. |$ 29,100.00| $ 29,100.00 | $ 37,850.00 [ $ 37,850.00 | $ 30,000.00 [ $ 30,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 [ $ 25,000.00
Furnish and Install Replace-ment
Motor Control Center and Motor
Feeder Conductors per the Plans
4. |and Specifications 1
L.S. |$ 20,800.00| $ 20,800.00 | $ 86,000.00 [ $ 86,000.00 |$ 102,969.00 [ $ 102,969.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 95,000.00 [ $ 95,000.00
Furnish and Install Replacement
Control Panel for Monitoring
Storage and Hydropneumatic
Tanks and Auto Dialer per Plans
and Specifications, Expansion of
Existing Auto-Dialer per Plans
5. |and Specifications 1
L.S. |$ 24,800.00( $ 24,800.00 [$ 17,750.00 [ $ 17,750.00 | $ 56,000.00 | $ 56,000.00 | $ 48,000.00 [ $ 48,000.00 | $ 79,000.00 | $ 79,000.00
Removal and Disposal of
Existing Auxiliary Engines, Direct
Connects, Foundation and
Enclosures, Including Capping
Existing Natural Gas Lines per
Code per Plans and
6. |Specifications 1
LS. |$ 5,00000|$% 5000.00|$ 9300.00[$ 9,300.00|$ 750000($ 7,500.00|$ 1,000.00|$ 1,000.00|$ 5,000.00[$ 5,000.00
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Project: North Forest M.U.D. Water Plant Improvements

Langford Engineering, Inc.
Project No. 259-015, Contract No. 1

Bid Tabulation

All Bidders 150 Calendar Days

Bid Date: 10:00 a.m.

Friday, April 30, 2010
Opened & Read at 10:00 a.m.
Friday, April 30, 2010
Langford Engineering, Inc.
Conference Room

Approx.
Item Quantity [ Pieper-Houston Electric, L.P. Neil Technical Services McDonald Electric Gemini Contracting Services, Inc.| W. W. Payton Corporation
No. Description of Work and Unit| Houston, Texas 5% B.B. [ Houston, Texas 5% B.B. | Houston, Texas 5% B.B. | Houston, Texas 5% B.B. | Katy, Texas 5% B.B.
7. |Demobilization 1
LS. |$ 3,00000]|$ 3,000.00 | $ 1,000.00($ 1,000.00 [$ 3,00000|$  3,000.00 |$ 3,000.00$ 3,000.00 |$ 1,000.00|$ 1,000.00
Alternate Bid
Manufacturer: Manufacturer: Manufacturer: Manufacturer: Manufacturer:
Cummins Detroit Diesel Detroit Diesel No Bid Detroit Diesel
Rating: 400 kW Rating: 405 Rating: 400 Rating: No Bid Rating: 400 kW
kw kw
# of Working # of Working # of Working
Furnish and Install Used or Pre- Hours Since # of Working # of Working Hours Since Hours Since
Owned Diesel Generator with Last Overhaul: Hours Since Hours Since Last Overhaul: Last Overhaul:
Minimum Capacity of 400 KW 1,000 Last Overhaul: Last Overhaul: No Bid 213 Hours
and ATS (Minimum 1,000 0 N/A
Working Hours Since Last TotaI‘Number o.f Total NL_lmber Total Ngmber
Overhaul) in Lieu of Base Bid Working Hours: Total NL_meer Total quber of Working _ of Working
Iltem 2, per the Plans and 12,500 of Working of Working Hours: No Bid Hours: 213
8. |Specifications 1 Hours: 213 Hours: 216
L.S. |$ 20000000 | $ 200,000.00 [$ 11426500 $ 114,265.00 [ $ 68,000.00 | $ 68,000.00 No Bid No Bid $ 130,000.00 [ $ 130,000.00
Total Amount Base Bid
(Item No. 1 Thru No. 7) $ 296,700.00 $ 317,915.00 $ 322,469.00 $ 330,000.00 $ 380,000.00
Total Amount Alternate Bid
(Item No. 8) $ 200,000.00 $ 114,265.00 $ 68,000.00 No Bid $ 130,000.00
Alternate Total Bid $ 297,700.00 $ 275,415.00 $ 287,465.00 No Bid $ 340,000.00

Notes:

Hi-Tech Electric submitted a
bid that was received after the
closing time and it was not
considered.

Bids Tabulated By: GLH
Bid Tab Prepared By: LMM
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